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So (two-thirds having voted in favor

thereof) the rules were suspended, and
the ¦¦concurrent resolution, as amend-
ed, was agreed to.

The result of the vote was an-
nounced as above recorded.

A motion to reconsider was laid on
the table.

NATIONALVOTER
REGISTRATION ACT OP 1989

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr,
McDermott). Pursuant toHouse Reso-
lution dm, and rule XXIII,the Chair
declares ttie House in the Committee
oí the Whole House -on the State of
the Ünion-for the consideration of the
bill,H.R. 2190.

D 1.452
IlffTHECOMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE

Accordingly, the House resolved
itself into the Committee of the
Whole House on the State of the
Union for the consideration of the bill
(H.R. 2190) to establish national voter
registration procedures for elections

Congressioanl Record -House
for Federal office, and for other pax-
poses, withMr,Hughes in the chair.

*

The Clerk read the titleof the MIL
The CHAIRMAN.Pursuant to the

rulé, the billis
'
considered as having

been read the first time.
Under the- rule, the gentleman from

Washington [Mr.Swift] willbe recog-
nized for 30 minutes, and the gentle-
man from California [Mr. ¦Thomas.]

willbe recognized for 3D minutes.
The Chair recognizes the gentleman

from Washington [Mr.Swift].
Mr. SWIFT. Mr. Chairman, Iyield

myself such timeas Imay consume.
. (Mr. SWIFT asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks .)

Mr. SWIFT. Mr, Chairman, we are
all familiar with the .sad record -of
votingin our Nation's elections. In the
last 30 years, voting participation has
declined almost 12 percent. Inthe last
Presidential election, only

"
slightly

more than half the eligible voters ac-
tually went to the polls.

Mr.Chairman, Iam greatly troubled
by those figures, andIknow many of
our colleagues in this House are simi-
larly concerned, for they indicate that
millions of citizens .are not participat-
ing inour democracy.

Many factors are responsible for the
dropoff in voting, some of which are
beyond -our ¦control. Higher voter turn-
out levels éaxft simply be legislative \y
mandated.

But we can do something about bj
far the most important factor, which
is registration, 'The simple fact -of the
matter is, you cannot vote if you are
not registered, and for many Ameri-
cans today, getting registered just is
not very easy, Indeed, when people
who didn't vote in 1988 were asked
why, the reason given most often was
not being registered.

Registration has been a barrier to
voter participation in -our democracy
since the late 19th -century, when the
poll tax and literacy tests were intro-
duced to prevent recent European im-
migrants, blacks, and the rural poor
from exercising their constitutional
right to vote. While the .enactment of
the Voting Rights Act of 1965 elimi-
nated the more obvious impediments
to registration, it left a complicated
maze -of local laws and procedures
through which -citizens miu-t' navigate.
Testimony before our e@a mil cc re-
vealed that in many jurisdictions
around the country, eligible voters
continue to be deprived of their right
to vote as a result of restrictive regis-
tration practices,

This is not only outdated— if it ever
had validity—but it is clearly hypo-
critical. In our system, no right is
more basic than the right to vote. Its
exercise is the very symbol .of demo-
cratic self -government.
It isnot that we don't know how to

do things better. Many States» inevery
region of the Nation have reformed
itieir registration laws, experimented
with improvements and found cost-ef-
fective ways, of making registration
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easier while.keeping the system secure
from fraud.

Today— with this bill—we have the
opportunity to gain from these labora-
tories of democracy and establish
some proven techniques to improve
voter registration all.across the land.
We have the chance to recognise once
and for'all that the role of our Gov-
ernment isnot to discourage voter par-
ticipation hut, indeed» to encourage it.

H.R, 2190, the National Voter Regis-
tration Act, is a bipartisan bill.which
ensures citizens wider ,and more con-
venient opportunities for registrad ;v.\

while stillmaintaining the integrity of
our electoral process. The billis the
product of extensive committee hear-
ings and meetings withcitizen groups,
academics, local officials, and many
other people concerned

'
about declin-

ing voter participation. In fact, the
central concepts of the billwere rec-
ommended to our committee by elee«
tion officials themselves, H.R. 2190
counts the .support of the League of
Women Voters, the Committee for the
Study of the American Electorate and
many other civic organizations. The
National .Association of Secretaries of
State has strongly endorsed the bill's
registration programs.
Ihave also worked closely with my

colleague -and the ranking Republican
member of my subcommittee, Bill
Thomas,, and Iwant to take special
note ofhis.substantial contributions m.
shaping this legislation. -Special credit
also goes to the majority whip, Bill
Gray, for crucial assistance, to Speak-
er Tom Fqliey, and to John Conyers,

whose efforts over the years to extend
the franchise to every citizen has
made the vote before u&e today possi-
ble.

ELR. 2190 is a very simple and
straightforward bill..First, let me tell
you what it does -not do. It does not
change the Qualifications for voting.
Age limits, citizenship and residency
requiieateii&s, laws dealing withfelon's
fights..None of those are changed.

Nor does the billin any way change
the rights and remedies contained M
the Voting Rights Act as amended, ©r

contain provisions for same-day regis-
tration.

What H.R. 2190 does do is cxi
the opportunities for registration in
three major ways.

First, the bill requires States to
permit eligible citizens to register
when applying for or renewing their
driver's licenses. This -is the so-called
motor-voter provisions. Some 87 per-
cent of Americans of voting age have
driver's licenses, so motor-voter will
make registration immediately accessi-
ble to millions of citizens from every
walk of Hie. And in States where per-
sonal ID's are available through motor
vehicle departments, that too willpro-
vide a convenient registration opportu-
nity.

We use the driver's license procedure
because it is a unique ¦system already
in place in all 50 States. Since the driv-
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ér's license application requires most
of the information needed to deter-
mine an eligible registration appli-
cant—and inmost States contains the
extra security protection of photo-
identification—the two systems are
ideal for meshing together. Infact, 12
States and the District of Columbia
have already developed motor-voter
registration programs, with great suc-
cess. ". : ..-v - • * , ¦¦¦¦..'¦

Second, the billrequires allStates to
allowcitizens to apply for registration
by mail. Postcard registration is avail-
able right now formore than half the
eligible voters inthe Nation, so the bill
simply extends this opportunity to ev-
eryone. The many States that have al-
ready implemented mail registration
programs report no increases in elec-
tion fraud.

Third, the billprovides for registra-
tion at various Government agencies,
such as Government revenue offices
and public libraries. Agency registra-
tion is also in wide use today.

These three registration programs
complement traditional procedures for
registering, such as registration at
State election offices and local court-
houses, and, when fully implemented,
willreach nearly every eligible voter.
With the exception of printing addi-
tional forms to take care of the antici-
pated increase in applications, they
should add littleburden to election of-
ficials. The State experience, for ex-
ample, indicates that motor-voter reg-
istration adds only a few seconds to
the total driver's license application
process.

Infact, the billwillgive election of-
ficials the necessary tools to do their
jobs more efficiently and cost-effec-
tively. Costly registration campaigns
can be reduced, the enormous expense
of overtime and extra help willI

'

be
largely eliminated, and by smoothing
out the registration process over the
full year, election officials will be
better able tomanage their operations
and serve the public.

The other major part of H.R. 2190
provides for the maintenance of accu-
rate and up-to-date registration lists.
Inaccurate registration lists are the
bane of every election official,can lead
to fraud and are extremely costly to
the states, political parties, candidates
and others who depend upon them for
effective voter contact.
In the course of our hearings, the

committee discovered a wide range of
procedures used by election jurisdic-
tions around the country to update
their lists. While some of these proce-
dures were entirely reasonable and ap-
propriate, others were questionable
and some blatantly discriminatory. No
one can really arque against having ac-
curate registration lists, but there are
Plenty of schemes and tricks around to
toock eligible people off the rolls.
More than 40 States currently purge
every citizen who fails to vote in one
or more elections. A number of States
actually drop nonvoters without any
notification.

It is the committee's clear intent
thatno one is tobe removed fromthe
registration rolls without clear evi-
dence that he or she no longer quali-
fies to vote. Infact, Mr.Chairman, the
committee felt so strongly about the
sanctity of registration, that the bill
bans States fromusing discriminatory
means, further, prohibits anyone from
being taken off the registration list
simply for failing to vote. These are
major reforms ofpresent practice.

The billprovides States with two op-
tions for verifying their registration
rolls.

The first option makes use of the
U.S. Postal Service's National Change
of Address Program. Under this inno-
vative program, voters who move will,
for the first time, be able to update
their registration information simply
by filling out standard change-of-ad-
dress forms—the same ones we use
today. This willallow States to trans-
fer the names of these voters from the
registration list in their former pre-
cincts onto the list in the precincts
into which they are moving. Not only
willregistration lists inboth locations
thus be automatically updated, but
States willbe able to notify relocated
voters of their new polling places.
Inlieu of this option, States are re-

quired to send registrants, at least
once every 4 years, a nonforwardable
address verification mailing. The bill
allows States to limittheir verification
mailings to people who failed to vote
inthe last general election. Individuals
whose nonforwardable mailing is re-
turned to election officials willbe sent
a second, forwardable mailing, inform-
ing them that if the elections board
does not hear from them within 30
days, their names willbe transferred
to an inactive, 4-year holding list. At
any time during that 4-year period, in-
dividuals so transferred may show up
at the polls and vote merely by estab-
lishing their eligibility.
Ibelieve— and so do most election of-

ficials—that the Postal Service option
is the one most jurisdictions will
select. Given that one-third of the
Nation moves every 2 years and that
recent movers are among the lightest-
voting groups today—due to difficul-
ties re-registering— itspotential impact
on voting participation is obviously
great. Moreover, it is inexpensive and
willeven save States money in the
longrun.

Which brings me to the subject of
cost. As with any investment, H.R.
2190 does entail some up-front ex-
penses. The Congressional Budget
Office estimates that compliance with
H.R. 2190 willcost States, in direct
outlays, an average of $20 million to
$25 milliona year for the first 5 years
of the program.

The first thing that should be noted
is that the billprovides States plenty
of help in implementing registration
programs. In fact, H.R. 2190 author-
izes "such sums as may be necessary,"
including up to $50 million in fiscal

year 1992 to help States verify their
registration rolls.

Second, costs under the billwillrap-
idly decline over time. For example,
costs associated with the motor-voter
program will decrease significantly
once the initial, 3- to 5-year driver li-
cense cycle in each State elapses. The
Michigan motor-voter program— Which
began in1975— serves 750,000 people a
year and costs just $1,000,000. That
comes out to 13 cents per transaction.

The expense of mail and agency reg-
istration programs will also decline
after the beginning "start-up" period,
during which time new forms must be
printed and distributed. The incremen-
tal, operating cost of individual regis-
tration transactions is very low. And
since registration lists willbe kept ac-
curate, States also willsave the print-
ing and postage expenses that arise
from sending ineligible voters costly
sample ballots and other voting mate-
rials.

We ailknow how difficultitis to es-
timate the cost of &new program, es-
pecially one such as this.But based on
the information gathered during our
hearings, Ibelieve the CBÓ's estimate
to be realistic.Ialso think it's impor-
tant toput the estimate inproper per-
spective. The real question, after all, is
not the expense of any specific provi-
sion contained in the billbut the cost
to our Nation ofmore than 50 million
unregistered voters. From that van-
tage point, $20 million to $25 million
inannual costs for the first 5 years of
the program is a small price to under-
write the vitality of our democracy,
andIam confident our appropriations
colleagues willhave no problems fund-
ing this legislation equitably.

Mr. Chairman, at this point let me
quickly respond to some of the ques-
tions Ihave most frequently been
asked about this bill:

Does the billprovide for same clay
registration? The answer isno, itdoes
not. After careful study, the commit-
tee determined that itis not feasible
at this point to mandate same day reg-
istration as a national procedure, al-
though the issue may be worthrevisit-
ing in several years, by which time im-
plementation of H.R. 2190 is likely to
have brought about a significant re-
duction in the niimber of eligible
voters stillunregistered.

Willthe billpromote election fraud?
The answer is absolutely no.H.R. 2190
is a tough antifraud bill.This legisla-
tion not only contains all the present
safeguards against fraud and abuse,
but goes beyond the security stand-
ards now inplace. Not only does it get
rid of the deadwootf on the rolls—
thereby reducing the potential for
fraud at the source— but it requires
every applicant for registration to sign
an oath under penalty of perjury that
he or she is eligible to vote. And as I
mentioned earlier, the motor-voter
program requires more identification
than current registration procedures.
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Does the billhave any affect oe the
Voting Rights Act as amended? Here
too, the answer is'no. AsImentioned
earlier, this billestablishes anew legal
framework addressing registration in
addition to existing law, in particular,
the Voting Rights Act. Nothing in this
bill!is meant to change the existing
rights and remedies provided under
the Voting Rights Act or to undercut
the standards of proof, governing that
act.

Does the enforcement section of the
billin anyway inhibit individuals or
groups from registering voters. Again,
the answer isno. While H.R. 2190 is a
strong antifraud bill, its enforcement
section appropriately covers only
those actions and omissions done in-
tentionally. This provision contains in
its frame the requirement that all ac-
tions and omissions covered by the sec-
tion be knowing and willful.The re-
quirement that individuals act "know-
ingly and willfully"stated inthe open-
ing frame to the section covers each
element of the- section, including those
in both subsection (1) and subsection
(2).

Getting BLR. .2190 to the floor has.
been a process of consultation, com-
promise, and refinement. What has
emerged from these wide discussions is
a billwhich can be supported by every
Member of this body who is truly in-
terested in expanding the opportuni-
ties for eligible citizens to register to
vote. This billhas wide bipartisan sup-
port, and for the record Fd liketonote
the followingMembers who wanted to
become cosponsors of H.R. 2:190 but
whose names were not included when
the committee's report was printed:
Representatives Bosco, Dellums,
Downey, Flake, Prank, Hayes, Ken-
nelly,Klezcka, Pease, Sabo, Stokes,
Towns, Waxman, and Welbon.

Mr. Chairman, our Nation has come
far in our electoral practices, granting
the franchise to blacks, women, and
these over the age of 18, and protect-
ing voters against -discrimination.

But too many eligible citizens today
fail to vote, in large measure because
too many obstacles to voting still
remain. Declining voter participation
is a national embarrassment and poses
potentially serious problems for our
politicalinstitutions.

As we applaud the outbreak of de-
mocracy and freedom abroad, we
should take this step to renew our de-
mocracy here at home. The founders
of this Nation expressly entrusted
Congress with the responsibility for
determining the manner by which
Members of this great body are elect-
ed. Our unfinished business is to
reduce the obstacles to voting to the
absolute minimum, while assuring that
our elections remain fair and secure.
H.R. 2190 is the most significant elec-
tion reform legislation since the
Voting Rights Act itself, represents a
giant step in that direction.Iurge my
colleagues to give itan overwhelming
vote of approval.

a isoo

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Iyield myself 8 minutes.

(Mr. THOMAS of California mked
and was given permission to revise and
extend his remarks.)

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, let me rise in support of a
piece of legislation which is less than
its critics have claimed it to be, and,
frankly, more than some of its sup-
porters believe itto be. Itis a piece of
legislation which, although compre-
hensive at the Federal level, provides a
significant amount of individual -deei-
sionmaking forStates and areas where
clearly the States should have that
kindof individual decisionmaking.
I, too, as my colleagues, the gentle-

man from Washington [Mr. -Swift],
the chairman of the subcommittee,
with whomIhave enjoyed a long and
mostly positive working relationship*
feel compeled primarily to talk about
what this billis not, since most of the
criticisms of the billare in fact criti-
cisms which the billdoes not deserve.
For example, Iwould urge allmy,col-
leagues to be very, very careful about
material that has been disseminated in
terms of cost. There is in fact one
piece of information from a study
group which,-says. that the cost ofH.R.
2190 to the Federal Government is
$200 million.Ifwe would examine the
documents, Ithink we would find that
the actual amount is $200,000.

Now, we are often accused of drop-
ping zeroes inspending money invari-
ous areas, butIwouldhope that when
we report on this bill,we would under-
stand that it is not a $200 millioncost
but a $200,000 cost.

During debate on the rule there was
an accusation that the billis virtually
useless because of its vagueness, for
example, in section 1-06. There is no
specificity in terms of the kinds of
criminal convictions under which
someone would be denied the right to
vote. There was a discussion about the
fact 'that ifthey meant a felony, they
should have said, "a felony," and if
they meant a misdemeanor, they
should have said, "a misdemeanor."
They said this billis too vague to be -of
any use, "and look at all the mandat-
ing that is required.""
Iwould urge my colleagues to read

the entire section in dealing with the
information on death, criminal convic-
tion, or -mental incapacity, because it
is stated over and over again in the
bill,after that kindof vitalstatistic in-
formation is transmitted to the .official
voter registration list for adjustment,
it is under .State law.The decision as
to which criminal conviction removes
someone from the voting: list is to be
determined under State law. What
kind-of mental incapacity is to fee de-
termined as to what removes someone
from the voter list is to he determined
under State law.
¦If someone wants to ..argue that we

are vague in that area, Iguess they
can argue on a specificity basis that we
are vague. We do not have the Federal

February 6, 1990
Government dicatating what specific

criminal convictions are. going tokeep
someone from or remove someone
from the voter list. We had no inten-
tion of doing that. We had no inten-
tion of involving ourselves in an arca
where the State* ought to make that
decision, and infact the toil!says that
the States should make that decision.

We also had some of our colleagues
upset by the fact that in their particu-
lar States fishing and hunting licenses
are sold at 7-Eleven's and other kinds
of convenience outlets, and that allof
a sudden the Federal Government is
mandating that the local 7-Eleven reg-
ister voters. Iwould entertain some-
one's examination of the billand the
terminology that was used in an at-
tempt to get government agencies to
involve themselves in the voter regis-
tration arca, requiring absolute neu-
trality under Federal penalty of law,
ina neutral way offering the opportu-
nity to register people, not in private
enterprise arcas, but for example, as
the billsays, in "fishing and hunting
bureaus," agencies of the government.

Now, we have an outreach program
for the private sector tobe involved if
they so wish. In California we have
been able to involve fast food fran-
chises . and outlets in a number -of
other arcas inoffering an opportunity
to register people to vote. Ithink,
given today's lifestyle of people, it is
not inappropriate that the Govern-
ment try to be as outoeaching and for-
ward-looking as possible, including the
private sector, in extending people an
opportunity to register.

Mr. Chairman, another complaint
levied against the billis that it is sup-
posed to increase voter turnout, .and
some say, "We really don't think itis
supposed to increase voter turnout or
we we don't think it will."Iwillask
them to turn to the purposes of the
ttét. Mo. I» itsays, "toincrease registra-
tion of citizens as voters." It is not
that the registered voters are necessar-
ilygoing to turn out. ,
Isay to my colleagues that Ithink

we have a vast amount of work to do
in the arca of an honest and fair ap«
portionment, in the arca of campaign
finance, and inputting back into the
picture local people so they can feel as
though they have a chance to influ-
ence an election. Allof those are items
that would affect turnout.-

What this bill intends to do -and
indeed does is to get people in a con-
venient way registered and, more im-
portantly, in an orderly fashion, re-
moved from the rolls so that what we
have are accurate rolls.Ithink a rea-
sonable program to get people to vote
is to, first of all, have an .accurate roll
from which one can make those
choices, not one which is exceedingly

difficult to get on or impossible to get
off, but one which is reasonable and
orderly inputting people on and rea-
sonable and orderly in removing them.

Mr. SWIFT. Mr. Chairman, Iyield
such time as he may consume to the
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gentleman from Maryland EMr.
MfumeJ.

(Mr... MFUME asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

¦ Mr.MFUME.Mr.Chairman, Ithank
the gentleman from Washington. IMr.
Swift]for yielding time to me, and I
rise in very strong support of the
measure before us today.

Mr.. Chairman* Iioin my colleagues instrong,
support of this momentous and historic piece
of legislation, KR 2190, the Voter Registra-
tion Act of 1989. This bill' will-make voter reg-
istration more accessible to the millions of
Americans who, for a. number- of reasons, d®
not have the means to register.

Five years ago we celebrated the 20th anni-
versary of the Votlng^ Rights Ac! of 1965 to
mark the significant progress we have made
in- allowing oyr .citizenry the opportunity to
vote. With the' passage of the 1965 act, many-
blatant and sinister obstacles administered l

through the repressive Jim Crow- laws wmm
dismantled. Yet, today many Americans--par-
ticularly minorities and low-income persons—
are still locked- out of the electoral process as
oilierimpediments prevent fed! participation In
the electoral process on election; day»

Mr. Chairman, the United States has one of
the worst voter turnout records among indus-
trialized nations. In the ¦Peesidential election:
year of 1984, only 53.1 percent of tie.- voting.
age went to the ballot 'box, and m1986- only
37.1,-, percent And only 50.8 percent of the
population- voted if*the last. Presidential elec-
tion. Sorna 75- millionAmericans úié ®eA par-
ticipate in the 1988 election and an amazin§
59 million of these citizens were not regis-
tered to vote at ad according- to. the ILS»,
census and voting registration; in the Novem-
ber 1988 report». The disappointingly, low.elec-'
tion turnout represents a. movement away
from the principle for which this Nation, has re-
vered over the last 200 years. Itis truly a trag-
edy when nearly half of our citizens do not
cast their ballots and exercise their rights' as
citizens. And, when we in the United- States
are in dead last among the democracies of
the world as a voting populous, Ibelieve that
it is our duty as elected officials to- remove
any barriers which prevent poütteal participa-
tion.

The right to cast one's ballot is. a sacred
one hallowed by the countless numfeer of men
and women who dedicated their lives during
the civilrights struggle togain equal rights for
all Americans, Everyone most have He oppor-
tunity to have a voice in oyr government. It
took the fives of James- Cheney, Andrew
Goodman, Michael Swerner, ana ©fliers to
awaken- Congress to the harsh realities of
voting impediments and prompted the Con-
gress to pass the Voting Rights Ac! of 1965,

These brave- patriots gave their fives so that
others may have the privilege they endeav-
ored to make available lor everyone. Ihope
that- their lives were not' lost m vain especially
when this Congress, en this day», of this yean
can extend universal suffrage and uphold the
one man, one vote' principie established 1 in the
Reynolds versus Sims case in- 1964. After
more than two decades,, we have taken, down
part of a wall denying African-Americans and
others the right to vote by removing; literacy
tests,, poll taxes, and other shenanigans. How-
ever, these have been replaced in disguise by
the inability to get to the polls» and missed op-

portunities to register. The low national voter
turnout in November 1988 represents a sad
chapter in the story of democracy.

Mr.Chairman, Iarm optimistic as we turn tte
pages of this story on to a new chapter. We
can and must provide the means to- allow
every American: the opportunity to take part: in
the decteionmaking process. H.R 2190 is the
mechanism that will engender greater voter
participation in the United States. This legisla-
tion simply allows voter registration white one-
registers for a driving: permit* or registration by
mail for those who- cannot register in person;.

In has already; been proven: ftiat when-
people register they are.fikelf to1 vote, hi fact*
some 80 to 90 percent of those registered ac-
tually cast their vote. However, only 60 per-
cent, of voting, age Americans are registered*
ln. a pott conducted after the t9BB- election,
more than one-third of the nonvoters surveyed
said that registration prevented tiiem from
voting in the election,. Thus, IiWnk we should
direct our efforts to removing obstacles to
voter registration., f- calí upon my colleagues m
this Chamber to move away from partisan pol-
itics and toward- cooperative politics so: that
the door of every- registrar in: the land will
always be open..

We must capitalize- on this occasion' to
move forward with the creed; of universal:' suf-
frage—an essential right in a political,demuo
racy. To remain true to- fte ideals- teiseribed in
our Constitution, the people of our great
Natron must be afforded the opportunity to
employ- their rights as citizens.
Iurge my colleagues to set an example for

the ratflßxts of Americans viewing, this debate
and' cast your vote In favor of the National:
Voter Registration Actof tató

Mr., SWIFT. Mr. Chairman» Iyield
4Vfe minutes to the clmirmaß of the
Committee ©n House Administration,
the gentleman from. Illinois lifeEm-
Nmvm&k

(Mr, ANMUNZIO asked ana was
given permission to revise and extend
his remarks* >
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Mr. ANNUNZIO. Mr.- Clmiri3.au, I
am proud to be one of the original co-
sponsors of BLR* 2&§Q* ané Irise in
strong support of it.As chairman of
the Committee on House Administra-
tion*.Iwant to congratulate the distin-
guished chairman of the Elections
Subcommittee» Mr. Swift,., for spon-
soring. HJL 219D-, a billthat would es-
tablish a uniform national standard
forvoter registration.
Ialso want to thank the hard-work-

ing ranking minority member, Mr.
Thomas» for his diligence and- coopera-
tionin both the subcommittee and in
fullcommittee.

Mr., Chairman, one of the precious
rights- guaranteed in©ur Constitution
is the right to vote. Toting must be
possiltfe for all. of our citizens if de-
mocracy is tohave meaning. From our
earliest days, restrictions on the right
to vote have been gradually eliminat-
ed. We no longer require voters to be
men,: property owners, or- long-time

residents to be eligible. This billtakes
the next step by eliminating yet an-
other barrier to full voting participa-
tion.

Voter turnout in the United States
has declined drastically and nearly
continuously since 1960. The MationaJ
Voter Registration Act of 1090 will
help reverse that troubling trend..
In 1984, there were approximately

168 millioncitizens of voting' age; 93
millionvoted for the President, while
75 milliondid not. In1986, 61 million
people voted for congressional candi-
dates, while 111 million- potential
voters failed to go to the polls.

Over three-fifths of eligible' Ameri-
cans did not vote in 1936, producing
the third lowest midterm election
turnout in a century and a half. Ex-
cluding the South, the 1986 voter par-
ticipation rate was- the lowest level re-
corded for an off-year election since
1798.

Major studies have been designed to
discover why so many Americans do
not vote. The No. 1reason was not
being registered* Registration proce-
dures have placed tremendous re-
straints on eligible voters for a long
time. This bill is. designed to remove
those restraints.

Nonvoters do- not vote because they
find out too- late they are. not regis-
tered. H.R. 2190 prohibits the removal
of

'
any individual simply for not

voting. Itestablishes address verifica-
tion procedures to update and main-
tain registration rolls*

The motor-voter registration; provi-
sion in the act wouldallowhigh seliool
students' to apply for voter registra-
tion when obtaining their driver's li-
cense.

H.R. 2190' provides mail-invoter reg-
istration, which willallow our senior
citizens, and handicapped citizens to
register' through the mail.Italso pro-
vides- voter registration- through Feder-
al and State agencies, granting maxi-
mum accessibility.

This billis tlxe result of a year of
hard werk by all of the members oí
Chairman Swift's Election Subcom-
mittee. In reaching tills final: stage,
both the majority and the minority
gave up some important positions», and
both the majority and the minority
gained some important language. This
is a bipartisan bill.Even the minority
views in the report are bipartisan. The
Committee on House Administration
has always tried hard to accommodate
and incorporate everybody's' views to
the maximum extent. Mr. Swift, and
Mr. Thomas have done so m this bill

The committee recognized that
States would incur some costs in set-
ting up new registration programs. We
provided for- $50 millionto help them
do so. That is about 25 cents for every
citizen eligible to vote. So cost should
not be any reason to- oppose this bill.
You should vote for this billbecause it
willmake it possible for many more
citizens to register and vote. It does
not make it easier to commit fraud—
on the contrary,, it provides additional
safeguards against fraud.

Mr. Chairman, this Congress has
talked a lot about compaign reforma
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So far, we haven't done much about
campaign reforms. This bill—a simple
and uncomplicated voter registration
bill—is a test of our willingness. Ifwe
can't act on this bill, what chance do
we have when we get down to business
on real campaign reforms? Ifwe mean
what we say, we have the opportunity
today toprove it.

Mr,Chairman, Iurge passage of this
bipartisan bill.

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Iyield 3 minutes to the
genteman from Minnesota [Mr.Fren-
zel], the distinguished former ranking
member of the Committee on House
Administration.

(Mr.Frenzel ask and was given per-
mission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

Mr. FRENZEL. Mr. Chairman, the
1988 Presidential election was a con-
tinuation of a trend that we have seen
in the United States since 1960 of de-
clining participation. Yes, there was a
half-percent bleep in 1984, but other-
wise we have been on a downhill
grade. Many of us have been embar-
rassed by the fact that even the citi-
zens of El Salvador are able to vote at
twice the participation rate as those
people who vote to install a United
States Congress in these seats in this
House.

Mr. Chairman, we have wondered
about this. We have pondered. We
have thought of ways to change our
procedures to encourage greater par-
ticipation.
Imyself have come to the conclusion

that a corollary of the right to vote in
this country seems to be the right not
to vote.

During this period the VotingRights
Act was passed. Nearly every State
moved to open up its registration pro-
cedures and add outreach processes as
well. Five States now currently have
no registration or Election Day regis-
tration. Even in spite of that the par-
ticipation rates have gone down.
Those States who have made their
processes most open have also had de-
clining participation rates.

Mr. Chairman, Iam not sure that
registration is particularly difficult or
restrictive out there in the States, and
yet, nevertheless, in our system I
think we have to take every effort to
make sure the system is as open as
possible and is attractive to potential
voters.
If we lived in a neutral world, it

would be my inclination not to inter-
fere in the State process, and for
many years Ihave stood before this
body and suggested we not do so. Now,
however, Ithink we have made a very
small step toward improving registra-
tion procedures, andIthink it is worth
the experiment.
Ido want to make it clear that my

support is not unconditioned. There
are a lot of ways to ruin this bill on
the way to enactment, and, if some of
those ways slips in, particularly large
amounts of money, Iam going to slip
out.

However, Mr. Chairman, Ido want
to say that it is time, after having
wrestled with this problem for 20
years in this Congress, to make some
very small improvements. The com-
mittee has wrestled in a very difficult
thicket.Imyself have labored on that
committee in what some have consid-
ered durance vile for nearly two dec-
ades. We never produced something
like this.

No, this is not perfect. Yes, it im-
poses on the States. Nevertheless it is
a very small step to tell our citizens
that we are trying tomake iteasier for
them to vote.

Mr. Chairman, the bill deserves a
chance. Iintend to try to give itone.

Mr.SWIFT. Mr. Chairman, Iyield 1
minute to the gentleman fromOregon
[Mr.DeFaziol.

Mr.DeFAZIO. Mr.Chairman, Icom-
mend Chairman Swift for his perse-
verance inbringing the National Voter
Registration Act to the floor for con-
sideration. The ballot is the single
most important toolcitizens can use to
influence our Government. Yet, voter
participation in this country remains
shamefully low. We must make it
easier for individuals to register and
stay registered to vote.

This billwillgo a long way toward
removing barriers that prevent and
discourage citizens from participating
in elections and exercizing their fran-
chise. Current voter registration pro-
cedures may not be as obviously dis-
criminatory as the poll tax, literacy
tests, and selective purges, but they
are discriminatory.

The opponents of the billsay this
legislation willresult in voter fraud
and an excessive financial and admin-
istrative burden on the States. That's
simply not true.

We don't have a problem with
people voting more than they should
inelections. We have a serious prob-
lemwithpeople not voting at all.

My home State of Oregon passed
motor voter registration legislation
last year. For a State with 2.5 million
residents, the operating costs are esti-
mated at about $400,000 between 1989
and 1993.

But we shouldn't be afraid of in-
creased voter participation. We have a
responsibility to encourage people to
vote. And to improve registration and
access to the polls. This billdoes that.

D 1520

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Iyield 2 minutes to the dis-
tinguished gentlewoman from Nevada
[Mrs. Vucanovich], a member of the
Committee on House Administration.

(Mrs. VUCANOVICH asked anstewas
given permission to revise and extend
her remarks.)

Mrs. VUCANOVICH. Mr.Chairman,
while Iwould like to commend Mr.
Thomas and Mr.Swift for their dedi-
cation and many months of hard work
on this legislation, Iam convinced
that H.R. 2190 is a classic example oí
good intentions gone bad.
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The National Voter Registration Act

would create a national system of
voter registration procedures, which
proponents argue, would increase the
registration rolls.Under this premise,
the proponents assume that increased
registration willresult in an increase
in voter turnout. This goal is noble
indeed, but H.R. 2190 willnot achieve
it. In the 1984 Presidential election,
my State of Nevada registered 41.6
percent of alleligible voters and had a
voter turnout rate of 80.4 percent. At
the time of the 1988 Presidential elec-
tion, motor voter was initiated and
voter registration had indeed in-
creased to 44.1 percent; unfortunately,
the turnout rate dropped 3 percent.
Additionally, a recent CBS-New York
Times poll of nonvoters showed 97
percent of nonvoters gave reasons
other than problems with the registra-
tion process. Further, 56 percent of
those polled could not give a specific
reason for not being registered or
simply had no interest in the election.
According to these figures, it is quite
doubtful that a significant increase in
voter turnout willresult.
Ina practical sense, the true cost of

this measure is stillunknown; infact,
State officials have indicated that itis
possible that this initiative could run
over $1 billion. Presently, $50 million
would be authorized for H.R. 2190,
however, CBO estimates that the real
costs to the Federal Government
would be $200 million annually and
direct costs to States and localities
could be as much as $90 million.Iam
concerned about the potential short-
fall which would have to be made up
by each State. Consequently, H.R.
2190 willtake precious funding away
frommore important programs.

Serious fraud issues are also raised
by this bill;it is in fact an invitation to
voter fraud. H.R. 2190 requires mail
registration without the benefit ofno-
torization or signature verification. In
addition, the measure does not allow
purging of nonvoters from lists and
more importantly, H.R. 2190 willre-
place all State voter fraud laws, re-
gardless of whether the original lawis
able to grant the State better protec-
tionagainst fraud.

Make no mistake, Isupport motor
voter registration and other voter out-
reach programs which will increase
voter participation. However, Ithink
that all of you will agree that each
State has a separate and unique iden-
tity whose idiosyncrasies conform to
the people wholive there. States must
have the freedom to design a system
that takes these differences into ac-
count.

Mr. Chairman, Members, before you
vote, read the billand find out how it
willaffect your State. Ifirmly believe
that this billis costly, onerous, may in-
crease voter fraud, and is simply un-
necessary. H.R. 2190, the motor voter
billis a lemon, and Iurge allMembers
to vote no on finalpassage.
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Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.

Chairman, Iyield: 2 minutes, to the
gentleman from Washington [Ml
Miller],a member who has been very
interested, in the area of voter registra-
tionreform.
(Mr.MILLERof Washington asked

and was given permission to revise and
extend his remarks.}"

Mr. MILLER of Washington.. Mr,

Chairman» first of all».Iwould like to
start b$r thanking and commending ray
colleague», the gentleman, from the
State .of Washington [Mr. Swift!for
his herculean efforts in behalf of this
legislation, and also Iwant to thank
and commend my colleague, the gen-
tleman from California [Mr.Tkomasl
forhis incredible efforts.

Now, Iunderstand
'

there are some-
Members who are concerned that the
rule on this legislation did not offer
enough opportunity for amendments,
andIsympathize with that andIsup-
port the effort to allow amendments.
Iunderstand that there are some

who MMmc that the antifrand provi-
sions could be made tougher, and t
is a commendable, effort; feat Mr.
Chairman, let us make no mistake
about this. This is a good: piece of leg-
islation.

In. America, a paltry 61. percent of
those eligible to vote do so, TMs in. a.
country that, is supposed: to set an ex-
ample of democracy around the world.

Mr*Chairman» more than- Mpercent
of those eligible to vote have a driver's;
license.. Through the simple act. of
making it possible to- register- to vote
whilegetting a driver*»license we have
the- chance to improve our shameful
voter turnout.

Eastern Europe is-crying out forpar-
ticipatory democracies. This, bill will
increase participation in this democra-
cy. Let us bring some of the voters
back into the voting, process.:

Mr.Chairman, Iurge my colleagues
tosupport BLR. 2190,

Mr.SWIFT. Mr.Chairman, Iyield t
minutes to the gentleman fromIllinois
EMr.Hayes}.

(Mr. HAVES of. Illinois., asked and
was given permission -to revise: and.
extend his remarks.)

-
Mr. HAVES of Illinois.11»; Chair-

man,. Irise today to- express my sup-
port for H.R. 2190,. legislation which
seeks to expand, the. opportunities for
eligible citizens, to register tovote;.

The National Voter Registration Act
is a. good, starting paint for addressing 1

the need to make easier the process- of
voter registration. While the billpro-
vides registration by mail as well as.
when applying for a driver's license,, I
am convinced that we can- still • da-
more.

As chairman of the Subcommittee-
oil Postal Personnel and Moderniza-
tion». I. have introduced legislation:
which, provides voter registration
forms along with the change address
fora through the U,S- Postal Service,
and which merely makes voter regis-
tration forms.- and information a¥atl~
able inu.& Postal facilities ItIs my

hope that we willsoon have an oppor-
tunity to consider other legislative ini-
tiatives so that we can continue efforts
to remove barriers to voter participa-
tion. However, today we focus our- at-
tention on H.R. 2190.

Being an active member over the
years of. the Civil Rights and Labor
Movements, Iam keenly aware ..of
those that literally died for the right
to vote in this country.. We must
always remain very aware of the strug-
gles- . set forth, to enact- the ¥oting;
Rights Act of 1965 and always be pre-
pared to- remove those- barriers which
prevent participation in this Nation's
political process.

As. we know Mr. Chairman,, 1repre-
sent a city that, has an many occasions.
set forth serious barriers- to voter reg-
istration and participation. Ihave wit-
nessed massive purges of the rolls in.
Chicago, obviously making itextreme-
ly difficultto again reach a reasonable
level of voter registrants.. Thousands
of. black and hispanic voters are clear-
ly lost through the purging process,,
yet today, some willtell yen that we
are not. inneed of a voter registration,
bill. H.R, 2190 clearly prohibits this
kind of activity, and we- in" Chicago-
need it*
Istrongly believe that the cost of

this billwillultimately be nominal on
the state-level,, including the State of
Illinois. We've already seen $xtremely
low cost estimates, out. of States such
as- Michigan, Minnesota,, and.Nevada..

¦ When we live' in a country where*
one-third of the electorate I—some1

—
some W

million people aren't registered to-
vate,, we are in dire need of. a legisla-
tive, remedy.. We are in need of uni-
formand nondiscriminatO'Fi voter reg-
istration laws, and therefore- 1encour-
age my colleagues' fervent support of
BLR. 21.§0 as- we vote today.

Mr.ROSTENKOWSKL Mr. Chair-
man* reluctant, as Iam to vote: against.
a MM crafted and supported by the
Democratic leadership of the. House,. I.
willvote "no"' on H.R. 2100w the Me,
tional. Voter Registration Act*on final
passage.. There are: simply too- many
aspects, ©f the*billwhich compel me to-
call for its. reworking as opposed to its
passage.

Primary among my concerns is that
the billcould make itmere difficultto
prevent* detect,, and prosecute voting
fraud. W® Federal court jurisdiction in
America has devoted more Govern-
ment resources to the elimination of
voting, fraud than the Northern Dis-
trictofIllinois.The cooperation- of our
local,. State,, and Federal, authorities, in
establishing and maintaining anti-
fraud practices- and procedures- is m
promising: and ongoing undertaking.

Unfortunately, some of the new
mechanisms required by the Ml,, de-
signed as they are to make' registration
easier and Quicker,, actually run
counter to the direction- of some of our
most, imaginative fraud prevention
measures.

For example, a Federal grand jury
w ?:ioh looked into alleged' voting fraud

in Chicago has. suggested tee use of
thumbprints on voter registration and
ballot application forms, in addition to
requirements, already in. place for au-
thenticating signatures.. The registra-
tion-by-mail provisions of the bill
before the .Bouse actually would
reduce the opportunities for checking
even the signatures.

Second, but still very important to
my State, the cost of implementing
the billis prohibitive. Since- it would
fall largely on State shoulders, 1 an
certainly not surprised' that we have
heard cries of objection from out gov-
ernors, secretaries' of state, and boards
of elections.

The Governor of Illinoisestimates
that the costs- of implementing- H.HL
2100 inmy State alone would exceed
$3-7 millionin the first year alone,, to
say nothing of the costs of maintain-
ing and operating the new system in
perpetuity.

Governor Thompson is hard-pressed
to know where that, money willcome
from, and he willfindno comfort in
turning to the U.S.. Congress for help.

Finally,. Ihave my own personal
doubts whether a bill such as EJ3L
21.90 addresses the actual cause of low
voter turnout.

We can relax, the requirements for
registration until it's like falling off a
log. We can spend, a lot of other gov-
ernments' money on removing every
conceivable obstacle between the voter
and the palling booth. But if the
voters do not believe they have a. stake-
in the outcome of the contest or the
results ®f the referendum, even, letting
them vote by fax will not bring the
count up a great deal.

¦ Icommend my leaders and my other
colleagues- on a. well-intentioned effort
inbringing this legislation -before the
full' bociy. Nevertheless, when- every
political leader inIllinoiswho has; eon- •

tacted me about this billhas urged me
to vote against, it,Ihave to- take that
intoacc&unt.

Let's-, collect the most, creative voter
registration techniques from around:
the country and make news of them
available to our State andjoeal elec-
tion officials.

Let's create incentives for- the adop-
tion and implementation of. those pro-
posals which, in. the studied judgment
ofthe local officials,, address- their spe-
cificneed&

And let's allow those jurisdiction&
who are pushing out the frontiers: of
anti-fraud and antiaiserifiiixmtiafipro-
grams ¦ to continue to* lead the- way,,
with oar help.

Over- and atove that* we could do
nothing more effective toward a better
turnout on election day than doing.
our jcbß honestly, creatively, and mm-
rageoHsly. In that way only—as op-
posed to artificial substitutes—can we
inspire new respect, new belief, and
new interest in representative govern-
ment on the part- of awt constituents»
The future of democracy in this- coen-
try depends on it.
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Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Iyield 3 minutes to the
gentleman from Michigan [Mr.
Upton], a distinguished Member in-
volved ina significant number of cam-
paign finance reform areas.

Mr. UPTON. Mr. Chairman, Michi-
gan has employed much the same ap-
proach that this bill embodies today
that is under debate this afternoon. In
fact, approximately 800,000 voters
take advantage of access to registra-
tion when they apply for or renew
their drivers' licenses. The system
runs at a cost that translates to about
13 cents per transaction. Itworks. The
system has been found to be very suc-
cessful. Ihave talked to a number of
my county and township clerks over
the last 10 days or so, and they are
very proud of the system that they
have, because they know that is per-
formance has done very well.

Michigan has an excellent record in
its conduct of registrations and elec-
tions.

The motor-voter registration works.
Now, the question is often asked, is

this an unreasonable Federal intrusion
into State functions? Well, we are not
trying to run the elections of the Fed-
eral Government. We are only trying
to establish a reasonable national
standard

'
providing ¦

•greater access to
registration. That is what this debate
should center on. States stillhave the
power to improve their system ifthey
so desire.

¦ AsIindicated, this works for Michi-
gan. Infact, in Michigan where they
have already begun to embark on a
computerization program that should
be completed by the midnineties, they
are going to have to roll that up a
littlebit earlier so that they can com-
plete that earlier than they had origi-
nally anticipated, but it isnot going to
be a problem. Infact, with the Federal
incentive now that willprovide some
funds for that, as it will to all 50
States, Michigan is in a good position.
This is good politics and it is good
policy, Iurge the Congress to adopt
this measure.

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, will the gentleman yield
briefly?

Mr. UPTON. Iyield to the" gentle-
man fromCalifornia.

Mr.THOMAS ofCalifornia. Itismy
understanding, Mr. Chairman, that
Michigan has the so-called motor-
voter.

Mr.UPTON. We do have it.
Mr. THOMAS of California. And

you are not computerized?
Mr. UPTON. It is not computerized

at this moment, though there are
steps to do so in the next couple of
years.

Mr.THOMAS ofCalifornia. Some of
our colleagues are concerned about
the fact that the billdoes not mandate
computerization. The gentleman has
found that the Michigan experience
has been a successful one, even though
Michigan at this time isnot computer-
ized?

Mr.UPTON. That is correct. Ithas
been a very successful program with-
out a computerization mandate. Ican
tell the gentleman from personal ex-
perience as one whohas moved froma
township to the city in the last couple
years, it works wonderfully.

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Ithank the gentleman very
much.

Mr. SWIFT. Mr. Chairman, Iyield
such time as he may consume to the
gentleman from Maryland [Mr.
McMillen].

(Mr.McMILLENof Maryland asked
and was given permission to revise and
extend his remarks.)

Mr.McMILLEN of Maryland. Mr. Chairman,
today Irise in support of H.R. 2190, the Na-
tional Voter Registration bill.Ibelieve that this
legislation is vital to improving the numbers of
registered voters in this country. While the leg-
islation does not include portions of a bill
which Iintroduced last year, the Jury Selec-
tion and Voter Participation Act of 1989, it is
my hope that in the near future the merits of
my legislation willbe considered.

It is essential, in a democracy, that juries be
composed of people who represent a cross
section of the community. This is an issue of
fairness and of individualrights under our con-
stitutional form of government. At the same
time, it is inappropriate that only these citizens
who are registered to vote or who actually
vote are selected to serve on juries. Service
on a jury should be viewed as an essential
component of responsible citizenship. Further,
it is fundamentally important for citizens to
participate in a democratic form of govern-
ment. The way for citizens in a democracy to
participate is with their votes. Unfortunately,
our most recent election marked a new low in
the level of voter participation. Our Nation is
the greatest democracy in history. At the
same time, the level of voter registration and
participation in the United States is nothing
short of abysmal, particularly when compared
to other western, industrialized democracies. S
am convinced—based not so much on find-
ings explained in volumes of studies and re-
ports, but on my own, often casual conversa-
tions with local elected officials, elections and
voter registration officials, and ordinary, every-
day people— that many Americans do not reg-
ister to vote because they do not want to
serve on juries. In this country, people who
have not registered to vote because of a fear
of jury service have articulated concerns
about inconvenience, including the actual time
involved and lost work, expense, and a gener-
al reluctance to become involved. It is clear
that people who do not want to serve on
juries, do not register to vote. By not voting,
these people are not exercising an important
right denied to so many others in the world.
Again—and this is a point that deserves to be
stressed— in a democratic system of govern-
ment, it is imperative that juries are a repre-
sentative cross section of the community. If
the possibility of serving on juries is a disin-
centive to people who want to vote and par-
ticipate in our elections, we should remove
this disincentive. The legislation Iintroduced
would amend the way that the clerks of the
Federal district courts develop rolls of those
eligible for jury duty. My bill would require the
use of substitutes» specifically information
compiled by the Social Security Administration
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and the Internal Revenue Service, for voter
registration lists or the lists of actual voters. In
addition, my bill recommends that trie States
develop their own lists of prospective jurors
that are not based on voter registration lists or
lists of actual voters. The States should use
other sources for compiling names of those to
serve on State juries, including records of
motor vehicle licenses and registrations, lists
of utility customers, and State or local income
tax returns. AIS citizens, age 18 or older,
should be eligible for jury service. We all ben-
efit from the freedoms and rights of American
citizens. Thus, aü citizens shall contribute to
those freedoms and rights by serving on
juries, if called. The selection process should
not be dependent on identifying prospective
jurors based on whether or not a person has
exercised his or her right to vote.

D 1530

Mr.SWIFT. Mr. Chairman, Iyield 2
minutes to the gentleman from Texas
[Mr.Frost].

(Mr. FROST asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

Mr. FROST. Mr. Chairman, Irise in
support of H.R. 2190. The need for
this legislation is very clear. Voter
turnout in our elections is at an em-
barrassingly low level. The united
States has the worst voting participa-
tion rate of the world's major democ-
racies.

Why is this the case? Let us examine
the facts. In the last Presidential elec-
tion only 50 percent of the people of
voting age in the United States actual-
ly voted. The fault lies in the stagger-
ing number of unregistered Ameri-
cans. Over 80 percent of the registered
voters inour country vote inPresiden-
tialelections by only 61 percent of the
voting age population is actually regis-
tered to vote. Let me say that again.
Only 61 percent of the voting age pop-
ulationis actually registered to vote. If
you are not registered, you can not
vote. So let us make it easier to regis-
ter and then maybe we willnot be in
last place inturnout anymore.

There are 21 States where less than
70 percent of the voting age popula-
tion is registered. These States are as
follows: Arizona, 69 percent; Arkansas,
68 percent; California, 67 percent;
Delaware, 65 percent; Florida, 63 per-
cent; Georgia, 63 percent; Hawaii, 54
percent; Kansas, 69 percent; Mary-
land, 66 percent; Nevada, 57 percent;
New Jersey, 67 percent; New Mexico,
61 percent; New York, 64 percent;
North Carolina, 69.8 percent; Pennsyl-
vania, 65 percent; South Carolina, 52
percent; Tennessee, 66 percent; Texas,
67 percent; Virginia, 63 percent; West
Virginia, 69 percent; and Wyoming, 64
percent.

H.R. 2190 seeks to provide uniform
national standards for voter registra-
tion laws and to do so in a manner
that makes iteasy for alleligible citi-
zens to register and that guards
against voter fraud.

H.R. 2190 requires that allStates es-
tablish procedures permitting people
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to register to vote by mail. A total of
26 States currently have registration
by mail, and the system has worked
wellin those States. H.R. 2190 also re-
quires States to provide for automatic
voter registration when someone com-
pletes an application for a driver's li-
cense. This is an innovative approach
already inuse insome States. Itis esti-
mated that linking voter registration
with the application for a driver's li-
cense would reach about 90 percent of
the voting age population.

This legislation represents change,
and change is never easy, particularly
for the local elections officials who
must administer the system. However,
we can not let resistance to change
prevent us frombecoming a better De-
mocracy. Iurge you to joinme in sup-
portingH.R. 2190.

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Iyield such time as he may
consume to the gentleman from Cali-
fornia [Mr.Campbell].

(Mr.CAMPBELL ofCalifornia asked
and was given permission to revise and
extend his remarks.)

Mr. CAMPBELL of California. Mr.Chairman,
Icannot support the proposed National Voter
Registration bill,H.R. 2190, because Isincere-
ly believe it to be unconstitutional. This is re-
grettable, because the purposes of the bill
are, generally, laudable. However, the Consti-
tution gives to the States and not to the Fed-
eral Government, the obligation to set qualifi-
cations for eligibility to vote in Federal elec-
tions. Here are the constitutional provisions
for elections for President, Representatives,
and Senators.

The Constitution provides the following for
setting qualifications for voters for Represent-
atives:

The House of Representatives shall be
composed of Members chosen every second
Year by the People of the several States,
and the Electors in each State shall have
the Qualifications requisite for Electors of
the most numerous Branch of the State
Legislature.

Article I, section 2: The Constitution pro-
vides the following for setting qualifications for
voters for Senators:

The Senate of the United States shall be
composed of two Senators from each State,
elected by the people thereof, for six years;
and each Senator shall have one vote. The
electors ineach State shall have the qualifi-
cations requisite for electors of the most nu-
merous branch of the State legislatures.

The 17th amendment (1913): Note this pro-
vision was adopted after the 14th amend-
ment—making it very hard to argue the 14th
amendment takes the power away from the
States when the 17th amendment gave the
power to the States.

The Constitution provides the following for
setting qualifications for the Presidential elec-
tors:

Each State shall appoint, insuch Manner
as the Legislature thereof may direct, a
Number of Electors, equal to the whole
Number of Senators and Representatives to
which the State may be entitled inthe Con-
gress. ...

Article 11, section 1: Finally, the Constitution
provides for the following explicit congression-
al authority in the area of elections:

The Times, Places and Manner of holding
Elections for Senators and Representatives,
shall be prescribed ineach State by the Leg-
islature thereof; but the Congress may at
any time by Law make or alter such Regula-
tions, except as to the Places of chusing
Senators.

Article !, section 4: To say who may vote is
not to prescribe times, places, or manner of
elections, it is to set eligibility requirements—
and, hence, it is reserved to the States.

In 1970, in Oregon versus Mitchell, the U.S.
Supreme Court upheld, 5 to 4, the Federal law
to compel States to allow 18 year olds to vote
in Federal elections. Despite the foregoing
clear provision of the Constitution, the Su-
preme Court held that the 14th amendment,
section 5, gave the Congress the necessary
authority— as part of the general guarantee of
"due process" and "equal protection." As-
suming that case, Oregon versus Mitchell,
would be decided the same way today, there
is a difference. To draft young Americans to
fight and possibly die at 18, but deny them the
right to vote, might weft have been a violation
of úue process, of equal protection. That is
not the case with the provisions of this bill,
however. These provisions deal with the ordi-
nary aspects of who shall be eligible to vote—
which provisions are left to the States. Many
have called for judges to interpret the Consti-
tution according to original intent Many call
for conservative judges, who will apply the
provisions of the Constitution rather than add
their own meaning to them. To these, Iask:
How can you support a congressional bill pre-
mised on a power not given to Congress—
indeed, explicitly given to the States? !f you
were the kind of judge you would want the
President to appoint, you would strike down
this law. You ought not support it as a
Member of Congress.

Mr. THOMAS of California. Mr.
Chairman, Iyield 3 minutes to the
more than distinguished -gentleman
fromKansas [Mr.Roberts], a member
of the Committee on House Adminis-
tration, a member of the Subcommit-
tee on Elections, and a watchdog for
the public.

(Mr.ROBERTS asked and was given
permission to revise and extend his re-
marks.)

Mr. ROBERTS. Mr. Chairman, I
thank the gentleman for yielding me
this time.

Mr. Chairman, let me begin by
saying that Ido not know of any
Member of this Congress who opposes
the intent of this bill, and ifIcan
really personalize those remarks fur-
ther, we do not really question the
intent, not to mention the hard work
of the subcommittee chairman, the
gentleman from Washington [Mr.
Swift], and our ranking member of
the subcommittee, the gentleman
from California [Mr.Thomas],

The motor voter trail, if you will,
has been long and arduous for both
gentlemen, butIhasten to add, howev-
er, that as a member of the subcom-
mittee, Inever really signed on with
this posse to increase voter turnout by
mandating Federal registration and
costs and regulation and hoops and
hurdles upon our State and our local
election officers and that whole

system. We are concerned about what
lurks under the banner of reform and
the lawofunintended effects.

We believe that voter turnout is im-
portant, but not at the expense of in-
tegrity, the sanctity and the workabil-
ity of the entire election process.
Much has been said about costs and
the cost estimates ranging from $10
million to $200 millionand down the
road, and if we stop to figure in the
cost to apply this mandate to State
and local elections, and that is what
willhappen, States willnot simply fi-
nance one system for Federal candi-
dates and another for State and local;
it could even reach $1billion.

There willbe gasps of feigned aston-
ishment from those who are propo-
nents of this bill,but that is the case.
The General Accounting Office, when
trying to figure out what the costs
would be, simply threw up its hands
and said itwas impossible.

We have heard a great deal about
fraud in this debate, and the propo-
nents state that new Federal authority
willadd a new layer of protection. We
have had lengthy staff meetings,
lengthy questions about proof of citi-
zenship, notarization forpostcard reg-
istration, the purge of nonvoters, put-
ting State and Federal employees in
the position of being elections officers.
Needless to say, these concerns
remain.

Finally let me say that my biggest
concern is the Federal intrusion in the
local and State election process and
the compliance chaos that willresult
in regard to cost reforms, duplication,
fraud, and election integrity.

Today perception is reality. We hear
that ifwe simply increase voter regis-
tration by automatically registering
everybody who has a driver's license or
everybody who walks in to see the
friendly folks where one gets their
hunting license, the fishing license,
marriage license, the friendly folks at
the welfare office, the unemployment
office, the post office, the school, yes,
the ASCS office in farm country, then
ifwe make them allelection officials,
then we save democracy and voter
turnout.

Reality: this is going to turn our
election process upside down.

Inclosing, let me simply say that we
agree with the increased goal of in-
creased voter participation and regis-
tration, but we do not agree that this
mandated Federal approach is the
right answer. Later in the debate, we
willhave an appropriate alternative
that will,in fact, increase voter regis-
tration but also safeguard the integri-
ty of the election process.

The CHAIRMAN. The Committee
willrise informally in order that the
House may receive a message.

MESSAGE PROM THE
PRESIDENT

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr.
Hayes of Illinois)assumed the chair.
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